Bid No. 14-025 Addendum #1
Temn Contract for Dewatered Waste Activated Sludge Disposal Services

BID SCHEDULE

11. Please see attached REVISED 08/08/13 Bid Schedule Page
*Note: Signature page has not changed but included for convince.

Receipt of this addendum MUST be acknowledged. Acknowledgment can be made by signing this addendum
and returning it to the Purchasing Division prior o the quote deadline (fax # (807) 586-4561, by mail or in person)
or by including a signed copy with your quote

Renee Loree, Senior Buyer

/"
Waste Management 8/28/2013

Company ignature Date
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SECTION 1, LOCAL TRANSPORTATION AND DISPOSAL
1.1 Local Transportation of Dewatered Waste Activated Sludge

1.A. Transport dewatered waste activated sludge from the MTP to a shipping facility or
to an approved local permitted disposal site.

Quantities, Number of Price per Round-Trip Total
Round-Trips (Quantity x Price per Round-Trip)
No bid No bid
MTP Estimated 255 Round-Trips $ $
Round-trip should include the 1 A Bid Total g Nobid

service of the driver.

1.B. Transport dewatered waste activated sludge from the JDTP to a shipping facility or
to the permitted local permitted disposai site.

Quantities, Number of Price per Round-Trip Total
Round-Trips (Quantity x Price per Round-Trip)
JDTP Estimated 450 il g Nobid ¢  Nobid

Round-trip should include the

: No bid
service of the driver, 1.B. Bid Total $

NOTE: Include all transportation costs except fuel surcharges. The City will pay fuel
surcharges if appropriately documented.

CBJ may also opt to use city owned truck and drivers for fransporting Dewatered Waste
Activated Sludge to the approved local permitted disposai site.

1.2. Local Disposal Cost Per Ton.

QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
Number of Tons Price per Ton Total Tons Estimated
7000 tons/year
Estimated 7000 tons/year $ 300.00 $ 2,100,000.00

INCLUDE THIS PAGE WITH YOUR BID
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INCLUDE THIS PAGE WITH YOUR BID
SECTION 1 continued.

NOTE: * “ton” means short ton equaling 2,000 pounds.

Disposal costs will be based on a per ton rate. Include all disposal costs except fuel
surcharges.

The City will pay fuel surcharges if appropriately documented.

Permitted Facility to which the dewatered waste activated sludge will be delivered:

(Verification of the permitted facility will be required prior to award).

Are you able to accept up to 435 MEeS of wet dewatered waste activated sludge

each week?

Waste Management 8/28/2013

Company Name Date

INCLUDE THIS PAGE WITH YOUR BID
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SECTION 2. NON-LOCAL TRANSPORT AND DISPOSAL (STANDARD HEIGHT-
Containers/Chassis Combination.)

2.A. Ship Contractor owned containers from the a shipping facility in Juneau, AK and
transport to the permitted disposal site. Return empty containers to the shipping facility in
Juneau, AK.

Quantities, Number of Price per Round-Trip Total
Round-Trips {Quantity x Price per Round-Trip)

Transport dewatered waste
activated sludge using fop-loading
intermodal standard height g 401785 441,930.50
container/chassis combination
based upon container loading of
15-25 wet tons per container.

TP Estimaied 450 [ 441,930.50

2.A. Bid Total $

2.B. Ship CBJ owned containers from the shipping facility and transport to the permitted
disposal site. Return empty containers to the shipping facility in Juneau, AK.

Quantities, Number of Price per Round-Trip Total
Round-Trips {Quantity x Price per Round-Trip)

Transport dewatered waste
activated sludge using fop-
loading intermodal standard

height container/chassis $ 3817.55 $ 419,930.50
combination based upon
container loading of 15-25 wet
tons per container.

JDTP Esti

419,930.50
mated 450 il 2.B. Bid Total $

NOTE: * *“ton” means short ton equaling 2,000 pounds.

Include all costs (shipping/transportation costs, containers, deuble-zippered container
liners, etc.) except fuel surcharges. The City will pay fuel surcharges if appropriately
documented.

For the transportation costs please provide bid totals for sections 2.A. and 2.B.

Please provide a separate bid total for non-local disposal costs for sections 2.0 and
3.0 as listed below under “Sections 2.0 and 3.0 -Non-Local Disposal Costs”
INCLUDE THIS PAGE WITH YOUR BID
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Permitted Facility to which the dewatered waste activated sludge will be delivered:
(Verification of the permitted facility will be required prior to award).
Maximum height of Standard Height container/chassis/related component combination:

Maximum allowable dewatered waste activated sludge load limit tonnage Contractor will
allow for Standard Clearance Height containers: 22 tons.

Additional loading, in excess of 25 tons and within the limit tonnage noted above, will be
paid at the per ton bid price. Pricing should be based on tonnage/container.

Waste Management 8/28/2013

Company Name Date

INCLUDE THIS PAGE WITH YOUR BID
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SECTION 3. NON-LOCAL TRANSPORT AND DISPOSAL
(Low Clearance Height Containers/Chassis Combination.)

3.A. Ship Contractor owned containers from the shipping facility in Juneau, AK and
transport to the permitted disposal site. Return empty containers to the shipping facility in
Juneau, AK,

Quantities, Number of Price per Round-Trip Total
Round-Trips {Quantity x Price per Round-Trip)

Transport dewatered waste
activated siudge using top-loading
infermodal low clearance height $ 4,017.55 $ 1,024,475.25
container/chassis combination
based upon container loading of
15-25 wet tons per container.

MTP Estimated 255 Round-Trips 3.A. Bid Total g 102447525

3.B. Ship CBJ owned containers from the shipping facility and transport to the permitted
disposal site. Return empty containers the shipping facility in Juneau, AK.

Quantities, Number of Price per Round-Trip Total
Round-Trips {Quantity x Price per Round-Trip)

Transport dewatered waste
activated sludge using top-
loading intermodal low
clearance height g 381755 $ 973,475.25
container/chassis combination
based upon container loading
of 15-25 wet tons per
container.

3.B. Bid Total $ 973,475.25

MTP Estimated 450

NOTE: * “fon” means short ton equaling 2,000 pounds.

Include all costs (shipping/transportation costs, containers, double Zippered container
liners, etc.) except fuel surcharges. The City will pay fuel surcharges if appropriately
documented.

For the transportation costs please provide bid totals for 3.A, and 3.B.

INCLUDE THIS PAGE WITH YOUR BID
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Please provide a separate bid total for non-local disposal costs for sections 2.0 and
3.0 as listed below under “Sections 2.0 and 3.0 - Non-Local Disposal Costs”

Maximum height of standard height container/chassis/related component combination:

Maximum allowable dewatered waste activated sludge load limit tonnage Contractor will
allow 50

for standard clearance height containers: tons.
Sections 2.0 and 3.0 - Non-Local Disposal Costs
QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
Number of Tons Price per Ton MTP and JDTP Total Tons
Estimated
7000 tons/year
MTP and JDTP combined 5 36.88 $ 258,160.00
Estimated 7000 tons/year
Sections 2.0 and 3.0 combined : 258,160.00
non-local disposal costs. Bid Total 3

NOTE: * “ton” means short ton equaling 2,000 pounds.

Permitted Facility to which the dewatered waste activated sludge will be delivered:
(Verification of the permitted facility will be required prior to award).

Maximum height of Standard Height container/chassis/related component combination:

Maximum allowable dewatered waste activated sludge load limit tonnage Contractor will
allow for Standard Clearance Height containers: 22 tons.

Additional loading, in excess of 25 tons and within the limit tonnage noted above, will be
paid at the per ton bid price. Pricing should be based on tonnage/container.

INCLUDE THIS PAGE WITH YOUR BID
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Estimated Labor Hours per Container

Estimated CBJ labor EXTENDED
QUANTITY hours per container to: 350 containers per year total
Number of Containers open, line, and secure for hours per year
transport
Estimated 350 containers/year 1 Hours | * 350 Hours

*Estimated CBJ labor hours requirements to open, iine, and secure various shipping
container types will be a considering factor in the bid award.

Add a line for total HOURS
350 Hours

SECTION 2.0 and 3.0 BID
Non-local Estimated CBJ Labor Hours.

Waste Management 8/28/2013

Company Name Date

INCLUDE THIS PAGE WITH YOUR BID
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No bid
$

SECTION 1.ABID
Local transportation from MTP to a shipping
facility or to permitted disposal site.

$ No bid

SECTION 1.BBID

Local transportation from JDTP to a shipping
facility or to permitted disposal site.

3 2,100,000.00
SECTION 1.2 BID

Local disposal costs per estimated 7,000 tons
per year.

¢  441,930.50 Wb

SECTION 2.A. BID
Transportation of standard height
container/chassis combination.

'l $ 419,930.50

'! SECTION 2.B BID

Transportation of standard height
container/chassis combination. Using CBJ
owned standard height container/chassis
combination.

$ 1,024,475.25 7

SECTION 3.A BID
Transportation using Low clearance height
container/chassis combination,

$ 973,475.25
SECTION 3.B BID

Transportation using Low clearance height
container/chassis combination. Using CBJ
owned low clearance height container/chassis
combination.

$ 258,160.00

"~ SECTION 2.0 and 3.0 BID
. LT Non-tocal disposal costs.

INCLUDE THIS PAGE WITH YOUR BID
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Eric Vance
Printed Name
5600 Tonsgard Ct 907-780-7801
Address Telephone Number
Juneau AK 99801 807-780-4235
City State Zip FAX Number
5600 Tonsgard Ct evance @wm.com
Address Email Address
TO BE CONSIDERED, bids must include the following:
1.  Signed Bid and Signature Document (including receipt of addenda).
2. Bid Schedule Pages 1, 2, and 3 (write ‘No Bid” if not bidding on a Section).
3. Affachment A, Insurance Requirements.
PRIOR TO AWARD
1. Verification of bidder's agreement with permitted disposal facility is required.
2. Verification of insurance must be provided.

3. Bid Bond or Surety Deposit must be provided.

INCLUDE THIS PAGE WITH YOUR BID
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Term Contract for Dewatered Waste Activated Sludge Disposal Services

The undersigned, as bidder, declare that we have examined all contract documents contained
herein and will contract thereon with the City and Borough of Juneau (hereinafter referred to as
the "City") to do everything necessary for the fulfillment of this contract. We agree any
addenda received are part of the contract documents.

Bids received after the time announced for the opening will not be considered. No bid may be
withdrawn after the opening time or before the award and execution of the contract unless the
award is delayed for more than 60 days.

The City reserves the right to reject any or all bids, to waive any informalities or to cancel the
invitation when in the City’s best interest. The City also reserves the right to determine the
lowest qualified, responsive, responsible bidder and which bid, if any, should be accepted.
When alternative bids are requested, the City may at its sole discretion award the basic bid or
the basic bid and one or more alternates.

Certification of Non-Collusion

We certify we have prepared our bid independently and without direct or indirect collusion,
restraint of trade or other unfair competitive practices.

INCLUDE THIS PAGE WITH YOUR BID
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Temm Contract for Dewatered Waste Activated Sludge Disposal Services

We understand that any false statements made fo meet any requirement may result in contract
cancellation or initiation of action under Federal, State or municipal laws and/or ordinances.

#1

Addenda Nos. Received

08/28/2013

Authrized Signature Date

Eric Vance
Printed Name

5600 Tonsgard Ct
Address

Juneau AK 99801
City State Zip

907-780-7801
Telephone Number

907-780-4235
FAX Number

evance@wm.com
E-Mail Address

B Check here if you qualify for 5% local bidder’s preference.
O Check here if you qualify for 10% disability preference.

TO BE CONSIDERED. bids must include the following:

2. Request for Bid page, includes addenda receipt (this page).
3. Bid Schedule page.

INCLUDE THIS PAGE WITH YOUR BID




